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where low-cost imports have caused or are threatening serious injury to domestic production. 
It conducts bilateral restraint negotiations with other governments and implements special 
measures of protection by means of import controls when required. It is also responsible for 
the conduct of international textile negotiations within the GATT and participates in the work 
of the Textiles Surveillance body established under the Arrangement regarding International 
Trade and Textiles. 
The Export and Import Permits Division is responsible for all matters relating directly or 
indirectly to commodity control measures under the authority of the Export and Import 
Permits Act and the United Nations Rhodesia Regulations. The purpose of the Act is to 
ensure, by means of export controls, that there is an adequate supply and distribution in 
Canada of goods necessary for defence or other purposes; that no specified goods having a 
strategic nature will be made available to any destination wherein their use might be 
detrimental to the security of Canada; that an intergovernmental arrangement or commitment 
is implemented; that any action taken to promote the further processing in Canada of a natural 
resource that is produced in Canada is not rendered ineffective by reason of the unrestricted 
exportation of that natural resource; and, that the export of any raw or processed material that 
is produced in Canada in circumstances of surplus supply and depressed prices is limited or 
kept under surveillance. 

By means of import controls, the Act is also intended to ensure an adequate supply in 
Canada of goods that are scarce in world markets, or subject to governmental controls in the 
countries of origin or to allocation by intergovernmental arrangement; to implement action 
taken under certain other specified federal acts; and to implement an intergovernmental 
arrangement or commitment. Other functions of this Division are to advise exporters and 
importers on interpretation and requirements of the Export Control, Area Control and Import 
Control Lists and Regulations; to study the economic implications of the Act; and to review 
Control Lists and practices. 
The International Bureaux (European Bureau, Pacific, Asia and Africa Bureau, and Western 
Hemisphere Bureau) provide the central departmental points of contact on matters affecting 
Canada's trade and economic relations with other countries and areas. The Bureaux are 
centralized sources of information on Canada's trade with specific countries or regions and 
they provide a regional perspective for matters of both international trade relations and export 
trade development. Their responsibilities include: developing Canada's international trade 
strategy and programs for individual countries and areas; maintaining and improving access 
for Canadian products to export markets through negotiation of trade agreements with other 
countries and consulting on trade relations and trade problems at the official level with foreign 
governments. They also provide information, advice and guidelines to government agencies 
and to the business community on foreign governments' trade and economic regulations and 
practices; maintain contact, normally through Canadian posts abroad, with foreign markets 
and foreign governments on matters pertaining to markets for Canadian exports; and provide 
advice to the Department, to other Canadian government agencies and to the Canadian 
business community on export market problems and opportunities. 
The Trade Commissioner Service has 88 trade offices in 63 different countries. Its primary role 
is to promote Canada's export trade and to represent and protect its commercial interests 
abroad. Accordingly, a trade commissioner is called upon to perform a wide variety of tasks: to 
act as an export marketing consultant; to bring foreign buyers into contact with Canadian 
sellers; to help organize trade fairs and trade missions in his territory; to recommend modes of 
distribution and suitable agents; and to report on changes in tariffs, exchange controls and 
other matters affecting Canada's trade with the countries to which he is accredited. He initiates 
programs to develop new markets for Canadian products, responds to inquiries from Canadian 
firms and provides advice on assistance to the Canadian exporter visiting his territory. In 
addition, he acts on behalf of the foreign programs of a number of federal government 
departments and undertakes agricultural reporting at specified posts. For a Canadian firm 
wishing to develop a market in his territory, the trade commissioner can supply information on 
product usage, if any, local production and import data, and prospective users or agents where 
appropriate. 

The scheduled return of trade commissioners for official tours of Canada is an effective 
means of assisting Canadian firms interested in the export trade, and trade associations are 


